
NOTICE OF COLLECTION OF BIOMETRIC DATA AND CONSENT 
 
Please be advised that ExamSoft Worldwide, Inc. (“ExamSoft”), its vendors and partners the proctoring 
software application that you intend to use, retain, and use Biometric Data (defined below) for the 
purpose of identifying you and recording you in the process of taking relevant examinations given by 
third parties with whom you’ve elected to take online examinations. 
 
“Biometric identifier” means a retina or iris scan, fingerprint, voiceprint, or scan of hand or face 
geometry. “Biometric information” means any information, regardless of how it is captured, converted, 
stored, or shared, based on an individual’s biometric identifier used to identify an individual.  Biometric 
Identifiers and Biometric Information is referred to hereafter as “Biometric Data”. 
 
The software application that you are about to access is a computer-based system that scans your 
image, records your voice, is sometimes interactive and records your response and monitors your 
behavior for purposes of validating that you are engaging in the examination process within the scope of 
the rules imposed by the third party examination provider.  This computer software extracts unique data 
points and creates a unique mathematical representation used to validate your performance against 
these examination rules., For example, are you referring to impermissible material in your possession or 
improperly communicating with a third party? 
 
ExamSoft retains, and requires its vendors and partners, to retain the Biometric Data only for so long as 
required by the examination giver. If you have any questions concerning the length of time for which the 
examination giver retains the Biometric Data, please ask the examination provider. 
 
You understand that you are free to decline to provide biometric identifiers and biometric information 
to the ExamSoft, its vendors, and/or the licensor of the proctoring software.  However, if you elect to 
decline to provide these identifiers and information, you may be prohibited by the examination giver in 
proceeding to take the examination. Your decision to decline to provide this Biometric Data and the 
examination givers response this this decision is yours and the examinations givers, between these two 
parties, and not between ExamSoft and you.  
 
By clicking the “I Accept” button below, you acknowledge that you have received and had the 
opportunity to review the description of the type of information collected, the use of the information 
collected and the retention policies of the data, voluntarily consents to the ExamSoft’s, its vendors’, 
and/or partners collection, storage, and use of Biometric Data through your computer device, and the 
use of the data for use in the proctoring process identified above, including to the extent that it utilizes 
the employee’s biometric identifiers or biometric information as defined in BIPA, and voluntarily 
consents to ExamSoft’s provision of such Biometric Data to its vendors, and/or the licensor of the 
proctoring software. 
 


